(Act:XII of 1887)

CONTENTS

Section

CHAPTER T CHAPTER

Preliminary OrdinarY

:1. Title, extent and comm- Extent of o
. encement. ' tion of Dist

Repeal of Acts 6 of 1871
~ and 19 of 1887.
CHAPTER II

_ ..Appeal from
ggﬁitétutiﬁn of Civil Additional J

Classes of Courts. gﬁgggésaggoﬁun
Number of District b
Judges, Subordinate CHAPTER IV
Judges and Munsifs. © Special Juriéd

éfhepealédJ?

P to transt
Vacancies among District d?ﬁgie Jud;egsg

or Subordinate Judges. MansifEs.

Zfﬂepaaled;7. Exercised by

3, Additional Judges. Judgi or Mngsi
¥ 5 |

g _'édminigtrative Control giéceﬁgaig pi.h
of Courts. - Di 7

. Temporary charge of Misposal of
Bi B Gaurt referred to
District Courts. ing section

Transfer of proceedings
~ on vacation of office of 2
. Simrainacs Judges. Tugee Sl




|
NS, - v
d org,-_tq

or an:y I-"v'u.

Pli

-

£l 2 ——
| a
37. Certain decisions to be 39. Subordination of Courts to
according to native law. District Court.
38. Judges not to try sults in  80. Application of Act to Pro-
which they are interested. vincial Courts of Small
Causass.

/ 11th March,1887_/

An Act to consolidate and amend the law relating to
the Civil Courts in Baengal, the North-Western PFrovinces
and Assam.

Whereas it is expedient to consolidate and amend the law
relading to Civil Courts in Bengal, the North-Westarn Provinces
and Assam

It is hereby enacted as follows 3
(
i

CHAPTER I J

Preliminarye.

1. Title, extent and commencement.=- (1) This Act may be /
called the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1337. —

(2) Tt extends to the territories (which were on the 11th
Marah 1887) respectively administered by the Lieutenant-
Governor of the North-wWwestern Provinces and the Chief Commissio-
ner of Assam except such protions of those territories as for

the time being are not subject to the ordinary civil jurisdic-
tion of the High Court. i

(3) It shall come into force on the first day of July,1887.

2. Repeal of Acts =& 6 of 187L and 19 of_1887. - (1) /Repe-

aled by the Amending Act, 1891 (12 of 1891)_/.
% LY

(2) All courts constituted, appointments, nominat%ation
and orders made, jurisdictions and powers conferred,
1ists published under the Bengal Civil Courts Act,1371,
enactment thereby repealed, or purporting expressly or in
to have been so constituted, made, conferred and publishe ;g
be deemed to have been mespectively constituted, made, coll.

_and published under this Act; and - “,
i
{ (3) Any eractment or document referring to the Bengal CTifi

q Sﬁﬂfyfﬁ Courts Act, 1871, or to any enactment thereby repealed, shall
all 4

be construed to refer to this Act or to the corresponding
portion thereof.

NOTES
This 2ct has been extended to Assam by Assam Act VI,*qgﬁ




CHAPTER II

Constitution of Civil Courts

8« 3. Classes of Courts. There shall be the following classes
of Civil Courts under this Act, namely 3

(1) the Court of the District Judge

(2) the Court of the additional Judge 7 :
(3) the Court of the Assistant District Judge: and
(4) the Court of the Munsife.

NOTES

InItem (3) of the section rthe words "Subordinate Judge" have
peen substituted by the words "Assistant District Judge" Wy
Assam Act XII of 1967,

When other Acts refer to Civil Courts, they do not refer to
some other Civil Courts; they refer to the Courts which are
known as Civil Courts under this Act. Under this saction, the
court of the Munsif, Additional Judge or Agsistant District
Judge, is one court though there may be more than one Munsif,
Assistant District Judge or as suche It is open for the High
Court and in some cases to tH{e Tocal Government, for mere ad-
ministrative purposes to say that for exercising the gurisdic=
tion of the Munsif in the 1dstrict there may be one or mMOre
Munsifs but every Minsif is 2 Munsif for the district although
by an administrative order he exercises jurisdiction over a
1iAfed part of the aistrict. Sectlon 3 lays down classes of
Civil Courts and as such the Registrar of a High Court is not
authorised_to determine the question covered by Rule 5 of
order 22 [/ Gyant Devi V. Lexehmi Dovi, AIR 1§75 Pat 133. 3

- e e T —

4. Number of District Judges, subordinate Judges and !
Mmunsifs. The State Government may alter the number of Dis trict o
Judges, subordinate Judges and Munsifs now Fixed.

5, Number of Munsifs. /“Repealed by the Decentralization
act, 1914 (4 of 1914)7/.

6. Vacancies among District or Subordinate Judges. (1)
Whenever the Court of District Judge or Subordinate Judge is
vacant by reason of the death, regiqnation or removal of the
Judge or other cause, or whenever an increase I the numnber
of District or subordinate Judges has been madqundex the
provisions af section 4., the State Government, or as the case
may be, the High Court may £111 up the vacancy ol appoint the

\ Additional District Judge Or Subordinate Judge.




(2) Nothing in this section shall be construed to prevent
a State Government from appointing a District Judge or Subor=
dinate Judge to discharge for such period as it thinks f£it, in
¢ addition to the functions develving on him as such District
Judge, or Subordinate Judge, all or any of the functions of
another District Judge, OX Subordinate Judge, as the case may
be.

NOTES

In Assam, there is 1o separate class of Court of Additional
Digtrict Judge. The Additional District Judge appointed in that
area under Section 6 (1) of this Act mEX must, therefore, be
deemed to be a division Court of the District Judge and not a
separate and district Court of its own. / Sagar Choudhury V.
Nalein Choudhury, AIR 1970 Assam and Nagaland 111ﬁ7. The power
of transfer of all pDistrict Judges 1is vested in High Court by
virtue of Article 235 of the Constitution.

m. vVacancies amgng Munsifs.== [/ Repealed by the Adaptation
of Laws Order, 1937 _/-

8. Additional Judges.=-{1) When the pusiness pending before
any District Judge requires the ald Yof Additional Judges for
its speedy disposal, the Srate Government may. having consulted
with the High Court, appoint such Additional Judges as may e
requisite.

(2) Additional Judges SO appointed shall discnarge any of

the functions, of a District Judge which the District Judge may

assign to them, and, in the discharge of those functions they
shall exercise the same powers as the District Judge.

NOTES

The power to transfer class or a particular case under th=
is section is_not barred. Bijan Kumar Bose V. Gouri Bose, AIR
1975 pat 131_/. There is no Additional Judge in Assame

9. Administrative control of Court.=-Subject to the Super=
intendence of the High Court the District Judge shallhave admi=-
nistrative control over all the Civil Courts under this Act -
within the local 1imits of his jurisdiction.

NOTES

For administrative control over subordinate Courts, refer=-
ence may be made to Civil Rulcs and orders (Volume 1), Chapter
33, This section places all Civil Courts in a district under
adhinistrative control of District Judge. within the local
1imits of his jurisdiction.

e

PSR Y ey -



Pl _. : e
(2) while in charge of the J£fice of the District Judge
Additional Judge or Suhofdingxefauﬂge.és'the.caséﬁmaylb@
subject to any rules which the High Court may make in tl
1£, exercise any of the powers of the District Judge.
: LR 'NOTES Tl | s
The senior Subordinate Judge, without relinguishin

- ordinary duties, may so assume temporaly charge of the du

‘of the District Judge subject however, to any rules which the
High Court may make to exercise any of the powers of the Dis=
. ¢rict Judge. There being no Subordinate Judge in Assam, the

- exclusive power of a District Judge connot be assumed by ol

B 1l. Transfer of oceedings on vacation of office of

. Subordinate Judges.=--(1) In the event of the death, resignatio
or removal of a Subordinate Judge, Or of his being inCapgg;
by illness or otherwlse @k for the performance of his duties, ot
of his absence from the pdace at which £ his Court is held, t
District Judge may, transfer all or any of the proceedings
ding in the court of the Subordinate Judge, either to
Court or to any Court under his administrative control &t

to dispose of them. S
: (2) Proceedings transferred under sub-section (L)%
disposed of as 1f they have been instituted in the Cou
which they are. so transferred. : e

(3) Provided that the Pistxict Judge may re-transfe
Court of the Subordinate Judge or his successors any pro
. transferred under sub-section (1) to his own Court or an
- Court. ; | TS
: (4) For the purposes of proceedings which are no per
in the court of the rdinate Judge on the occurrence:

event referred to in sub-section (1), and with respe

. that Court has exclusive jurisdiction, the District Judg
f that Cour

NOTES

absence of Assistant Pistrict Judge, the Disti
setent to hepg an appeal from the order or decx
“Mangilal Agarwalla V. Jamunalal |[Agarwall

/%)

d Nagaland 122_/.

v — —— -




— D -

12. Temporary charge of offiice of Mungiff
by the Adaptation of Laws order, 1937_/.

13. Power to fix local limits of jurisdic
(1) The State Government may, by notification i
Gazette, fix and alter the local limits of the
any Civil Court unde¥ this Act.

(2) If the same local jurisdiction is ass
more Subordinate Judges or two OX MOre Munsiffs
Judge may assigyn ta each of them such civil bus
by the Subordinate Judge or Munsiff as the case

s.=-/ Repealed

tion of Conrts,=m:

n the official
jurisdiction of

igned to two or
, the District

iness cognizable
may be, as sub-

ject to my general or special orders of the High Court, X he

Ehinks filte

(3) When civil business arising in any local area ls assi-

gned by the District Judge under sub=section (2

), to one or two

or more Subordinate Judges Or to one or tWwo or more Munsiffs, a
decree or order passed by the Sybordinate Judge or Munsif shall
not be invalid by reason only of the case in which it was made
having arisen wholly or Iin part in a place beyond the local
area if .that psm place is within the local limits fixed by the

State Government by Sub-section (1).

(4) The Judge of a Couri of Snall causes appointed to be

allrso Subordinate Jucge or Mmmsiff, as the case
the meaning of this saction. -~

may be, within

(5) The present local limits of the jurisdicgtion of
avery Civil Court under this Act shall be deemed to nave heen

fixed under this section.

NOTES

An order under Section 13 (2) does not affect a transfer

of jurisdiction, because it merely distributes,

as a matter ot

administrative convenience and with reference to ceriain local
areas, the civil business amongest two o mols Courts each of

which has jurisdiction over the whole area. But

where A the

State Government has conferred on him a particular jurisdiction}

that cannot be divested by District Judge.

The District Judge cannoi Laka away the jurisdiction of a

Court to execute a decree passed by it, when i1t
Court which can execute it under the provisions

i

is the only
of Section 38

read with Section 37 of the ivil Procedure Code. Where phe
trial Judge who tried the case at Gauhati, had ju;isdictlon to

try the case at Tezpur and vice versa, the fact
try the case at Tezpur but at Gauhati would not

that he did not
maka the order

or judgement invali@ for that reasons Z-AIR 1952 Assam 88_7.

The Supreme Court held in Triogi Math v. Indian Iron and
Steel Co. Ltd. / AIR 1963 SC 205_/that the labour Courts con=

stituted under the Tndusirial Disputes Act have
with the courts ~onstituted under this Act.

no comparisorn

14
Y



[

— I —

The_Allahabad High Court held in Nand Kishore v. Mool
Chandra / AIR 1966 All 613 / that Section 31 of the Arbitration |
Act does not pravent a Distrlcet Judge from exercising his powar .
of transfer under Section 13, or under the provisions of C.P.C.

e e

14. Place of sitting of Courts.==- (1) The State Government
may by notification in the Offijiclal Gazette, fix or alter the
place or places which any Civil Court under this Act is toke held

(2) All placas at which any such courts are now hgld,shall
be desmed Lo have been fixed under this section.

NOTES

It is not the actual sitting on.,a particular day that
determines the situation of the Court but the situation is de-
termined by the placed of sitting as required by the Law for
that purpose.

15. Vacations of Chirits.--(1) Subject to such orders as
MEMEXAE may be nade by the State Government the High Court shall,
prepare a list of days to be observaed in oach year as holidays
in the Civil Courts.

(2) The list shall be published in the official Gazette.

¢ (3) A judicial act done by a Civil Court on a day speci-
fied in the list shall not be invalid by reason only of its
having been done on that day.

NOTES

Under the Negotlable Tnst#uments Act, when a day is deol 3¢
red to be a holiday, the High Court may also by a notification
declare a holiday for the Civil Courts subordinate to it under
this Bection.

Lal

i —

16. Seals of Court.--Every Civil Court under this Act i
shall use a seal of such form and dimensions as are prescribed
by the State Government.

17.Continuance of ovroceadings of Courts ceasing to have
jurisdiction.~-(1) Wherce any Civil Court under this Act has A
for any cause ceased to have jurisdiction with respect to any
case, any proceeding in relakion to that case which, if that
Court have not ceased to have jurisdiction, might have Been,
had the case therein may be had in the court to which the busi-
ness of the former Court has been transferred.

(2) Nothing in this section applies to cases from which
provision is made in Sections 35,327 and 114 of, and Rule 1 ok



-zj-

order XLVII in Schedule I to the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908,
or in any other enactment for the time being in force.

NOTES

Under the clrcumstances when the court which passed the
decree is abolished, it is the court to which its business X
is transferred is competent to execute the decree.

S

CHAPTER III
ORDINARY JURISDICTION

18. Extent of original jurisdiction of District or
Subordinate Judge.--Save as otherwise provided by any enactment
for the tlme being in force, the jurisdiCtion of a District
Judge or Subordinate Judge extends, subject to the provisions
of Section 15 of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 to all
original suits for the time being cognizable by Civil Courts.

NOTES

The figure "1908" nhas been inserted by Assam Act VI of
1935,

19. Extent of juriadiption of Munsif.--(l) Save as aforasal
and subject to the provision of sub-section (2), the jurisdictlo
of a Mu %ﬁ extends to all like sults of which the value does W
exceed %%Eé@-thousand rupees.

(2) The State Government may, © the recommendation of ths
High Court, direct, by notificationinxthe official Gazette with
respect to any Mmunsif named therein that his jurisQég%%pn shall
extend to all like sulits of such value not exceedlug Live thou=
sand rupees as may be specified in the notlificatlion 3 K

provided that the State Government may, by notification in
the official Gazette, delegate to the High Court its powers unde
this Sectlon. :

NOTES

The sub=-clause (b) in sub-section (2) has been deleted by
Assam Act IX of 1965 and by the same Assam Amendment Act, Sub-
clause (a) has been merged in sub=gection (2) and for the woxrds
"one thousand" occuring in sub=section (1) the words "three
thousand" has been substituted and in sub—-section (2) for the
words "two thousand", the words "five thousand" have been
substituted. .



20. Appeals from District and Additional Judges.=-=(1)Save
as otherwilse provided by any enactment for the time being in
force, an appeal from a decree or order of a District Judge or
an Additional Judge shall lie to the High Court.

(2) An appeal shall not lie te the High Court from a
decree or order of an Additional Judge in any case in which 1if
the decree or order has been made by the District Judge, an
appeal would not lie to that Court. _

NOTES

This section does not glve right of appeal from every or=-
der of a Pistrict Judge to the High Court. It only deals with
the form of appeal.

In Assam there is no Additional Judge at present.

D b — e v s e

2l. Appeals from Subordinate Judges and Munsifs.--(1)Save
as aforesald, an appeal from a decree or order of a Subordinate
Judge shall lie=-

(a) to the District Judge where the value of the
original suit in which or in any proceeding arising out of
which the decree or order was made did not exceed se
thousand rupees. tﬂg:;ﬁ

(b) to the High Court in any other case.

(2) Save as aforesaid, an appeal from a decree or an orde
of a Munsif shall lie to the District Judge.

(3) Where the function of receiving any appeals which
to the District Judge under sub-sectiion (1) or sub=section {2
has been assigned to an Additional Judge, the appeals may be pt
' ferred to theAdditional Judge.

(4) The High Court may, with the previous sanction of the
State Government direct, notification in the official Gazety
that appeals lying in the District Judge under Sub-section (2)
from all or any of the decrees or orders of any Munsif shall be
preferred to the Court of such Subordinate Judge as may be men-
tioned in the notification , and the appeals shall thereupon be
preferred accordingly.

NOTES

In clause (a) of sub-section (1), for the words "five
thousand rupees", the words "seven thousand rupees" have been
substituted by Assam Act IX of 1965, and these provisions shal
apply irrespective of the fact that suits, proceedings,decrees
or orders out of which the appeals referred to therein arise we
instlituted or made prior to the commencement of Assam Amendmeng
Act IX of 1965. |

. Under Section 5 (2) of the sald Assam Amendment Act, not
withstanding anything to the contrary contained in the Limita*
Act, 1963, an appeal from a decree or order made before the
commencement of this Amendment Act, which but for the provisi
of such Act, would have been preferred before the High Court




within ninety days from the date of such decree or order, shall
be preferred before the District Judge, within the said period.
Nothing in this Amendment Act shall be deemed to affect any
appeal instituted prior to the commendement of such Act.

It is true that an appeal from an original order or decree
of the Court of Munsif shall lie to the Assistant District Judge
even then on the occurence of an event under Section 11(4) of
the Act, a District Judge may exercise all or any jurisdiction
of the Court of Assistant District Judge. [ﬁahgilal, Agarwalla
v. Jamunalal Ararwalla, AIR 1971 Assam and Nagaland 122_/.

- v Y

CHAPTER IV
SPECIAL JURISDICTION

22. Power to transfer to Subordinate Judges, appeals from
Munsifs.=--(1) A District Judge may transfer to any Subordinate
Judge under his administrative control any appeals pending kmxfx
before him from the decress or orders of Munsiffs.

(2) The District Judge may withdraw any appeal §o trans—
faerred and either ¥hear and dispose of 1t himself or transfer it
to a Court under ¥ his administrative control competent to
dispose of it.

(3) Appeals transferred under this section shall be dispo
sed of subject to the rule applicable to like appeals when
disposed of by the District Judge. .

NOTES

A District Judge, to whom an appeal is preferred under
Section 21 against an order of the Munsif, has power to transfd
the appeal to a Subordinate Judge and the latter has the Juris-
diction to dispose of the appeal.

23. Exercise by Subordinate Judge or Munsif of jurisdicti.
of District Court in certain proceedings.--(1) The High Court
may, by general or special order, authorize ang Subordinate Jud(
or Munsif to take cognizance of, or any Distrift Judge to trans
fer to a Subordinate Judge or Minsif under his administrative
control, any of the proceedings next hereinafter mentioned or a
class of those proceedings speclfied inthe order.

(2) The proceedings referred to in sub-section (1) are th
following namely :

(a) Proceedings under Bengal Regulation 5, 1799 (to
limit the interference of the Zilla and City Courts of
Diwani Adalat in the execution of wills and administratll
to the estates of persons dylng intestate). i

[(b) Je e e e ok e S ke e ok _7.
[(c) J o de K K dek Kok Kok ok _7__



(d) Proceedings under the Indian Succession Act,
1925 which cannot be disposed of by District Delegates;
and

(e) References by Collectors under paragraph 5 of
the Third Schedule to the Code of Civil Procedure; 1908.

(3) The District Judge may withdraw any such proceedings
taken cognizance of by, or transferred to, a Subordinate Judge
or Munsif, and may either himself dispose of them or transfer
them to a Cour¥ under his administrative control competent to
dispose of them.

NOTES
This section has been amended by Assam Act VI of 1935.

24. Disposal of proceedings referred to in last fore=-
golng section.--(1) Proceedings taken cognizance of by, or
transferred to, a Subordinate Judge of Munsif, as the case may
be, under the last foregoing section shall be disposed of by
him subject to the rules applicable to like proceedings when
disposed of by the District Judge:

Provided that an appeal from an order of a Munsif in
any such proceedings shall lie to the District Judge.

(2) An appeal from the order of the District Judge on
the appeal from the order of a Munsif under this section shall
lie to the High Court if a further appeal from the order of th
District Judge is allowed by the law for the time being in
force.

25. Power to invest Subordinate Judges and Munsifs with
Small Causes Court jurisdiction.--The State Government may, by
notlfication in the official Gazette, confer, with such local
limits as it thinks fik upon any Subordinate Judge or Munsif
the jurisdiction of a Judge of a Court of Small Causes under
the Provincial sSmall Cause Courts Act, 1887 for the trial of
sults cognizable by such Courts up to such value not exceeding
seven hundred and f£ifty rupees in the case of a Subordinate
Judge or three hundred rupees in the case of a Munsif as it
thinksv;it, and may withdraw any jurisdiction so conferred:

Provided that the State Government may, by notification
in the official Gazette delegate to the High Court its powers
under this section.

NOTES
Section 25 is amended by Assam Act VI of 1935.

e T

/ Chapters V and VI containing Sections 26 to 29 and
30 to 35 have been repealed _/.




o canfer powers ef5 vil C
efnmaah may invest with *ﬁw

i (2) Hothing ke ions 4.5, 6} 3..1:-__,_
it an "officer so invested, but xhm all the
thi t, shadll, so far as those pravisie s
oly to him as if he were a Judge o:
: 1 of which he is invested. i

.ere in the territories mentioned
(1), the same local jurisdiction
icars invested with the powers
ed with the powers of a District
-tion of the State Governmen
ub=section (2) of Section 13
@ powers of a Subordinate Judg &

”ihvésted with the powers of a Munsif.

Eﬁh&re the place at which the Court o -5 ar
ﬂ%_th the powers under subesection (1) is
been fixed under Section 14, the Court
ce within the local limits of ¥ his I

37;=Certain decislons to be under Native
. sult or other proceeding it is necessary
> decide any question regarding successic
: ,iage or caste, or any religbous usage or i
the Mohammadan Law in cases whete the parties are
‘amd tte Hindu Law in cases where the parties are
form the rule of decision except in so far as such L3
; legislative enactment, been altered or abolished.

(2) In cases not provided for in sub-section (i
any other law for the time being in force, the Cou
according to justice, equity and good conscience.

NOTES

Under thés section neither Hindus nor Mdhmuh
nst their will should be subjected to the law of
allaws a person to adopt for himself any speci
+ In a case of a &x dispute ahou
in Bengal the




=13 = SR Heeg
38. Judges not to try/in which they are interested.=
: hall not Ity any sul

‘or in which he is

The presiding officer of a C
or other proceeding to which he
personnally interested. = = = . e ; i
(2) The presiding officer of an Appellate Civil Court
under this Act, shall not try an appeal against a decree or S
order passed by himself in another capacity. = = e
(3) When any such suit, proceeding or appeal as is refe-
rred to in sub-section (1) or sub=section (2), comes before
any such officer, the officer shall forthwith transmit the :
record of the case to the Court to which he is immediately
subordinate with a report of the circumstances attending the
referencea. ! o
(4) The Superior Court shall thereupon X dispose of the,
case under Section 24 of the Code of Civil Procedure,1908.

(5) Nothing in this section shall be deemed to affect th
extraordinary original civil jurisdiction of the High Court. i

NOTES

This section has been amended by Assam Act VI of 1935.

39. Subordination of Courts to District Court.-- For thg
purpose of the last foregoing section, the preslding officer ¢
a court subject to the administrative control of the District
Judge shall be deemed to be immediately subordinate to the
Court of the District Judge, and for the purpose of the Codej
Civil Procedure, 1908 the Court of such an officer shall be |
deemed to be of a grade inferior to that of the Court pf the
District Judge. wa

44 et
40. Application of Act to Provincial Courts of Small |
Causes.=--(1) This section, and Sections 15,31,37,38 and 39 |
apply to the Court of Small Causes constituted under the
Provincial Causes Courts Act, 1887.

(2) save as provided by this Act, the other section§,§
this Act do not apply to those Courts. 4




	scan0001
	scan0002
	scan0003
	scan0004
	scan0005
	scan0006
	scan0007
	scan0008
	scan0009
	scan0010
	scan0011
	scan0012
	scan0013

